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Bible

Genesis 1:26-27
And God said, Let us make man in our image, after our likeness: and let them have dominion 
over the fish of the sea, and over the fowl of the air, and over the cattle, and over all the earth, 
and over every creeping thing that creepeth upon the earth.

So God created man in his own image, in the image of God created he him; male and female 
created he them.

Proverbs 31:10, 13-14, 16, 18-20, 25-26, 30-31
Who can find a virtuous woman? for her price is far above rubies.

She seeketh wool, and flax, and worketh willingly with her hands.

She is like the merchants’ ships; she bringeth her food from afar.

She considereth a field, and buyeth it: with the fruit of her hands she planteth a vineyard.

She perceiveth that her merchandise is good: her candle goeth not out by night.

She layeth her hands to the spindle, and her hands hold the distaff.

She stretcheth out her hand to the poor; yea, she reacheth forth her hands to the needy.

Strength and honour are her clothing; and she shall rejoice in time to come.

She openeth her mouth with wisdom; and in her tongue is the law of kindness.

Favour is deceitful, and beauty is vain: but a woman that feareth the Lord, she shall be praised.

Give her of the fruit of her hands; and let her own works praise her in the gates.

Ruth 1:1-11, 14-16, 18-19, 22
Now it came to pass in the days when the judges ruled, that there was a famine in the land. And 
a certain man of Beth–lehem–judah went to sojourn in the country of Moab, he, and his wife, 
and his two sons.

And the name of the man was Elimelech, and the name of his wife Naomi, and the name of his 
two sons Mahlon and Chilion, Ephrathites of Beth–lehem–judah. And they came into the country 
of Moab, and continued there.



And Elimelech Naomi’s husband died; and she was left, and her two sons.

And they took them wives of the women of Moab; the name of the one was Orpah, and the 
name of the other Ruth: and they dwelled there about ten years.

And Mahlon and Chilion died also both of them; and the woman was left of her two sons and her 
husband.

Then she arose with her daughters in law, that she might return from the country of Moab: for 
she had heard in the country of Moab how that the Lord had visited his people in giving them 
bread.

Wherefore she went forth out of the place where she was, and her two daughters in law with 
her; and they went on the way to return unto the land of Judah.

And Naomi said unto her two daughters in law, Go, return each to her mother’s house: the Lord 
deal kindly with you, as ye have dealt with the dead, and with me.

The Lord grant you that ye may find rest, each of you in the house of her husband. Then she 
kissed them; and they lifted up their voice, and wept.

And they said unto her, Surely we will return with thee unto thy people.

And Naomi said, Turn again, my daughters: why will ye go with me? are there yet any more 
sons in my womb, that they may be your husbands? →

And they lifted up their voice, and wept again: and Orpah kissed her mother in law; but Ruth 
clave unto her.

And she said, Behold, thy sister in law is gone back unto her people, and unto her gods: return 
thou after thy sister in law.

And Ruth said, Entreat me not to leave thee, or to return from following after thee: for whither 
thou goest, I will go; and where thou lodgest, I will lodge: thy people shall be my people, and thy 
God my God:

When she saw that she was stedfastly minded to go with her, then she left speaking unto her.

So they two went until they came to Beth–lehem. And it came to pass, when they were come to 
Beth–lehem, that all the city was moved about them, and they said, Is this Naomi?

So Naomi returned, and Ruth the Moabitess, her daughter in law, with her, which returned out of 
the country of Moab: and they came to Beth–lehem in the beginning of barley harvest.

Luke 8:40, 1-3
And it came to pass, that, when Jesus was returned, the people gladly received him: for they 
were all waiting for him.



And it came to pass afterward, that he went throughout every city and village, preaching and 
shewing the glad tidings of the kingdom of God: and the twelve were with him,

And certain women, which had been healed of evil spirits and infirmities, Mary called 
Magdalene, out of whom went seven devils,

And Joanna the wife of Chuza Herod’s steward, and Susanna, and many others, which 
ministered unto him of their substance.

Luke 7:36-50
And one of the Pharisees desired him that he would eat with him. And he went into the 
Pharisee’s house, and sat down to meat.

And, behold, a woman in the city, which was a sinner, when she knew that Jesus sat at meat in 
the Pharisee’s house, brought an alabaster box of ointment,

And stood at his feet behind him weeping, and began to wash his feet with tears, and did wipe 
them with the hairs of her head, and kissed his feet, and anointed them with the ointment.

Now when the Pharisee which had bidden him saw it, he spake within himself, saying, This 
man, if he were a prophet, would have known who and what manner of woman this is that 
toucheth him: for she is a sinner.

And Jesus answering said unto him, Simon, I have somewhat to say unto thee. And he saith, 
Master, say on.

There was a certain creditor which had two debtors: the one owed five hundred pence, and the 
other fifty.

And when they had nothing to pay, he frankly forgave them both. Tell me therefore, which of 
them will love him most?

Simon answered and said, I suppose that he, to whom he forgave most. And he said unto him, 
Thou hast rightly judged.

And he turned to the woman, and said unto Simon, Seest thou this woman? I entered into thine 
house, thou gavest me no water for my feet: but she hath washed my feet with tears, and wiped 
them with the hairs of her head.

Thou gavest me no kiss: but this woman since the time I came in hath not ceased to kiss my 
feet.

My head with oil thou didst not anoint: but this woman hath anointed my feet with ointment.

Wherefore I say unto thee, Her sins, which are many, are forgiven; for she loved much: but to 
whom little is forgiven, the same loveth little.

And he said unto her, Thy sins are forgiven.



And they that sat at meat with him began to say within themselves, Who is this that forgiveth 
sins also?

And he said to the woman, Thy faith hath saved thee; go in peace.

John 19:25, 38, 40-41
Now there stood by the cross of Jesus his mother, and his mother’s sister, Mary the wife of 
Cleophas, and Mary Magdalene.

And after this Joseph of Arimathæa, being a disciple of Jesus, but secretly for fear of the Jews, 
besought Pilate that he might take away the body of Jesus: and Pilate gave him leave. He came 
therefore, and took the body of Jesus.

Then took they the body of Jesus, and wound it in linen clothes with the spices, as the manner 
of the Jews is to bury.

Now in the place where he was crucified there was a garden; and in the garden a new 
sepulchre, wherein was never man yet laid.

John 20:1, 11-18 Mary 
The first day of the week cometh Mary Magdalene early, when it was yet dark, unto the 
sepulchre, and seeth the stone taken away from the sepulchre.

Mary stood without at the sepulchre weeping: and as she wept, she stooped down, and looked 
into the sepulchre,

And seeth two angels in white sitting, the one at the head, and the other at the feet, where the 
body of Jesus had lain.

And they say unto her, Woman, why weepest thou? She saith unto them, Because they have 
taken away my Lord, and I know not where they have laid him.

And when she had thus said, she turned herself back, and saw Jesus standing, and knew not 
that it was Jesus.

Jesus saith unto her, Woman, why weepest thou? whom seekest thou? She, supposing him to 
be the gardener, saith unto him, Sir, if thou have borne him hence, tell me where thou hast laid 
him, and I will take him away.

Jesus saith unto her, Mary. She turned herself, and saith unto him, Rabboni; which is to say, 
Master.

Jesus saith unto her, Touch me not; for I am not yet ascended to my Father: but go to my 
brethren, and say unto them, I ascend unto my Father, and your Father; and to my God, and 
your God.

Mary Magdalene came and told the disciples that she had seen the Lord, and that he had 
spoken these things unto her.



 
Science and Health with Key to the Scriptures by Mary Baker Eddy

362:1-23 np
It is related in the seventh chapter of Luke’s Gospel that Jesus was once the honored guest of a 
certain Pharisee, by name Simon, though he was quite unlike Simon the disciple. While they 
were at meat, an unusual incident occurred, as if to interrupt the scene of Oriental festivity. A 
“strange woman” came in. Heedless of the fact that she was debarred from such a place and 
such society, especially under the stern rules of rabbinical law, as positively as if she were a 
Hindoo pariah intruding upon the household of a high-caste Brahman, this woman (Mary 
Magdalene, as she has since been called) approached Jesus. According to the custom of those 
days, he reclined on a couch with his head towards the table and his bare feet away from it. It 
was therefore easy for the Magdalen to come behind the couch and reach his feet. She bore an 
alabaster jar containing costly and fragrant oil, — sandal oil perhaps, which is in such common 
use in the East. Breaking the sealed jar, she perfumed Jesus’ feet with the oil, wiping them with 
her long hair, which hung loosely about her shoulders, as was customary with women of her 
grade.

Did Jesus spurn the woman? Did he repel her adoration? No! He regarded her 
compassionately. Nor was this all. Knowing what those around him were saying in their hearts, 
especially his host,  — that they were wondering why, being a prophet, the exalted guest did not 
at once detect the woman’s immoral status and bid her depart, — knowing this, Jesus rebuked 
them with a short story or parable. He described two debtors, one for a large sum and one for a 
smaller, who were released from their obligations by their common creditor. “Which of them will 
love him most?” was the Master’s question to Simon the Pharisee; and Simon replied, “He to 
whom he forgave most.” Jesus approved the answer, and so brought home the lesson to all, 
following it with that remarkable declaration to the woman, “Thy sins are forgiven.”

225:29-31
Men and women of all climes and races are still in bondage to material sense, ignorant how to 
obtain their freedom.

247:10
Beauty, as well as truth, is eternal; but the beauty of material things passes away, fading and 
fleeting as mortal belief. Custom, education, and fashion form the transient standards of 
mortals. Immortality, exempt from age or decay, has a glory of its own, — the radiance of Soul. 
Immortal men and women are models of spiritual sense, drawn by perfect Mind and reflecting 
those higher conceptions of loveliness which transcend all material sense.

268:6
 Belief in a material basis, from which may be deduced all rationality, is slowly yielding to the 
idea of a metaphysical basis, looking away from matter to Mind as the cause of every effect. 
Materialistic hypotheses challenge metaphysics to meet in final combat. In this revolutionary 
period, like the shepherd-boy with his sling, woman goes forth to battle with Goliath.

67:32
The epoch approaches when the understanding of the truth of being will be the basis of true 
religion. At present mortals progress slowly for fear of being thought ridiculous. They are slaves 
to fashion, pride, and sense. Sometime we shall learn how Spirit, the great architect, has 



created men and women in Science. We ought to weary of the fleeting and false and to cherish 
nothing which hinders our highest selfhood.

49:1
The women at the cross could have answered Pilate’s question. They knew what had inspired 
their devotion, winged their faith, opened the eyes of their understanding, healed the sick, cast 
out evil, and caused the disciples to say to their Master: “Even the devils are subject unto us 
through thy name.”

314:12
When Jesus spoke of reproducing his body, — knowing, as he did, that Mind was the builder, — 
and said, “Destroy this temple, and in three days I will raise it up,” they thought that he meant 
their material temple instead of his body. To such materialists, the real man seemed a spectre, 
unseen and unfamiliar, and the body, which they laid in a sepulchre, seemed to be substance. 
This materialism lost sight of the true Jesus; but the faithful Mary saw him, and he presented to 
her, more than ever before, the true idea of Life and substance.

570:14
Millions of unprejudiced minds — simple seekers for Truth, weary wanderers, athirst in the 
desert — are waiting and watching for rest and drink. Give them a cup of cold water in Christ’s 
name, and never fear the consequences. What if the old dragon should send forth a new flood 
to drown the Christ-idea? He can neither drown your voice with its roar, nor again sink the world 
into the deep waters of chaos and old night. In this age the earth will help the woman; the 
spiritual idea will be understood. Those ready for the blessing you impart will give thanks. The 
waters will be pacified, and Christ will command the wave.

516:21
Man and woman as coexistent and eternal with God forever reflect, in glorified quality, the 
infinite Father-Mother God.

587:3
Gihon (river).  The rights of woman acknowledged morally, civilly, and socially.
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